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COMMISSIONERS COURT 

REGULAR MEETING 

APRIL 24, 2019 

 

BE IT REMEMBERED that on this day, the Commissioners Court of Kaufman County, Texas met in a 

meeting in the Kaufman County Courthouse Annex, 2
nd

 Floor Meeting Room, Kaufman Texas with the 

following members present:  Hal Richards, County Judge; Mike Hunt, Commissioner Precinct No. 1; Skeet 

Phillips, Commissioner Precinct No. 2; Terry Barber, Commissioner Precinct No. 3; Ken Cates, 

Commissioner Precinct No. 4; Laura Hughes, County Clerk.  

INVOCATION; 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE TO THE AMERICAN FLAG; 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE TO THE TEXAS FLAG; 

REMARKS FROM VISITORS; 

ROUTINE CORRESPONDENCE 

MOTION TO APPROVE CONSENT AGENDA 

2. There came on to be a motion to approve the Consent Agenda. 

2A. Accept Star Transit Ridership Reports for March 2019. 

2B. Accept Commissioners Court Meeting Minutes for April 10, 2019 and April 18, 2019. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Terry Barber and seconded by Commissioner Skeet Phillips  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE PROCLAMATION 

3. There came on to be a motion to approve a Proclamation proclaiming the month of May as Motorcycle 

Safety and Awareness Month in Kaufman County. 

Motion was made by Commissioner and seconded by Commissioner  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE APPOINTMENT 

4. There came on to be a motion to approve appointment of Courtney Repka Wortham to the Child Welfare 

Board. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Mike Hunt and seconded by Commissioner Ken Cates  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE RESOLUTION 

5. There came on to be a motion to approve amended Resolution regarding National Crime Victims' Rights 

Week and National Law Enforcement Appreciation and Memorial week. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Terry Barber and seconded by Commissioner Skeet Phillips  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 
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MOTION TO APPROVE CONTRACT 

6. There came on to be a motion to approve renewal of Transportation Services Contract between Kaufman 

County and Innovative Transportation Solutions (ITS). 

Motion was made by Commissioner Ken Cates and seconded by Commissioner Mike Hunt  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE LEASE AGREEMENT 

7. There came on to be a motion to approve Lease Agreement for one (1) 2019 KOMATSU GD655- 6 Motor 

Grader in the amount of $253,623.00 from Kirby Smith Machinery, utilizing Buyboard Contract #521-16 for 

Precinct 3. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Terry Barber and seconded by Commissioner Skeet Phillips  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE PRICE REDETERMINATION 

8. There came on to be a motion to approve FIVE STAR Correctional Services Price Redetermination on 

meal services, effective June 1, 2019. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Skeet Phillips and seconded by Commissioner Ken Cates  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE DISPOSAL OF COUNTY ASSETS 

9. There came on to be a motion to approve Receipt, Transfer, and Disposal of County Owned Assets. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Terry Barber and seconded by Commissioner Skeet Phillips  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO TABLE REPLAT 

10. There came on to be a motion to Table Replat of Meadowbrook Acres lots 18, 19 and 20, located in 

Precinct 1. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Mike Hunt and seconded by Commissioner Terry Barber  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE FINAL PLAT 

11. There came on to be a motion to approve Final Plat for the Minter Addition Lots 1-4, located in Precinct 

3. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Terry Barber and seconded by Commissioner Skeet Phillips  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE ORDER 

12. There came on to be a motion to approve Court Order Amending Angelina Road Distance; Precinct 1. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Mike Hunt and seconded by Commissioner Skeet Phillips  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 
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MOTION TO ACCEPT REPORT 

13. There came on to be a motion to accept Treasurer's Monthly Report for March 2019. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Skeet Phillips and seconded by Commissioner Terry Barber  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO ACCEPT REPORT 

14. There came on to be a motion to accept Treasurer's Quarterly Report. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Ken Cates and seconded by Commissioner Mike Hunt  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO ACCEPT REPORT 

15. There came on to be a motion to accept Treasurer's Quarterly Investment Report. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Skeet Phillips and seconded by Commissioner Terry Barber  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO ACCEPT REPORT 

16. There came on to be a motion to accept Tax Assessor-Collector’s Monthly Report for March 2019. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Skeet Phillips and seconded by Commissioner Ken Cates  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO ACCEPT REPORT 

17. There came on to be a motion to accept Sheriff’s Monthly Report for March 2019. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Terry Barber and seconded by Commissioner Skeet Phillips  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO ACCEPT REPORT 

18. There came on to be a motion to accept Indigent Healthcare Quarterly Report. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Mike Hunt and seconded by Commissioner Ken Cates  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO ACCEPT REPORT 

19. There came on to be a motion to accept Veterans Service Monthly Report 

Motion was made by Commissioner Terry Barber and seconded by Commissioner Skeet Phillips  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE LINE ITEM TRANSFERS  

20. There came on to be a motion to approve Line Item Transfers  

Motion was made by Commissioner Skeet Phillips and seconded by Commissioner Terry Barber  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE CLAIMS FOR PAYMENT 

21. There came on to be a motion to approve Claims for Payment for $805,675.51. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Ken Cates and seconded by Commissioner Mike Hunt  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 
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MOTION TO APPROVE EXITING REGULAR MEETING 

AND ENTERING INTO EXECUTIVE SESSION 

22. There came on to be a motion to approve exiting the Regular Meeting and entering into Executive 

Session: Pursuant to §551.074 of the Texas Government Code to interview prospective candidates for 

the Information Technology (IT) Director position. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Mike Hunt and seconded by Commissioner Terry Barber.  

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

EXECUTIVE SESSION 

23. Executive Session was held.  County Judge has Certified Agenda. 

MOTION TO APPROVE EXITING EXECUTIVE SESSION AND 

ENTERING INTO REGULAR MEETING 

24. There came on to be a motion to approve exiting the Executive Session and entering into Regular 

Meeting. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Terry Barber and seconded by Commissioner Ken Cates. 

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO APPROVE AUTHORIZATION TO EXTEND OFFER 

25. There came on to be a motion to approve County Judge Hal Richards to talk to applicant and extend 

offer of employment for Information Technology Director position. 

Motion was made by Commissioner Skeet Phillips and seconded by Commissioner Terry Barber. 

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

MOTION TO ADJOURN 

26. There came on to be a motion to adjourn.  

Motion was made by Commissioner Skeet Phillips and seconded by Commissioner Ken Cates. 

Motion was put to a vote.  Motion carried and is so ordered. 

 

I, Laura Hughes, County Clerk of Kaufman County, Texas, do hereby certify that the above Commissioner 

Court Minutes are a true and correct record of the proceedings from the Commissioners Court Meeting.  

 

ATTEST:  

 

Laura Hughes, County Clerk 
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COMMISSIONERS COURT 

SPECIAL MEETING  

APRIL 26, 2019 

 

BE IT REMEMBERED that on this day, the Commissioners Court of Kaufman County, Texas met in a 

Special Meeting in the 86
th
 Judicial District Courtroom, Kaufman Texas with the following members 

present:  Hal Richards, County Judge; Mike Hunt, Commissioner Precinct No. 1: Absent; Skeet 

Phillips, Commissioner Precinct No. 2: Absent; Terry Barber, Commissioner Precinct No. 3: Absent; 

Ken Cates, Commissioner Precinct No. 4: Absent; Bobbie Bartlett, Deputy County Clerk. 

     SPECIAL MEETING 

There came on to be a Special Meeting to attend the 422
nd

 District Court Drug and Mental Health 

Graduation. 

  

I, Laura Hughes, County Clerk of Kaufman County, Texas, do hereby certify that the above 

Commissioner Court Minutes are a true and correct record of the proceedings from the Commissioners 

Court Meeting.  

 

ATTEST:  

  

Laura Hughes, County Clerk 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Delinquent Court Fines 

Collection Report to 

Kaufman County 
  

 

April 2019 
 

 

 

Submitted by: Dan Romo, J. Douglas Burnside, Melissa Pace 

500 E. Border Street * Suite 640 * Arlington * Texas * 76010 * (817) 461-3344 

 www.pbfcm.com 



2016
$966,992

2017
$586,302

2018
$434,109

Qtr. 1, 2019
$167,301

2016*
$1,966,248

2017*
$584,858

2018*
$476,131

Qtr. 1, 2019*
$163,567

Remaining Balance
$9,703,301

Kaufman County Justice of the Peace 1,2,3 & 4 Summary
Delinquent Court Fine Collections

Performance Thru March 31, 2019

Total Turnover
$15,048,809

Total Resolved
$5,345,508

Source: Kaufman County JP's 1,2,3 & 4 Court Data Download / Perdue System.  Perdue started collecting for JP's 1 & 2 in January 2015 and JP's 3 & 4 in 
January 2016.  *Cases consisting of the following: fine reductions, dismissals, jail credits, community service or cases sent in error. 

Collections by Perdue Brandon Fielder Collins & Mott, LLP

Total Case Resolution
All JP's*, $3,190,804

Total Dollars Collected
All JP's, $2,154,704



2016
$238,975

2017
$126,846

2018
$100,791

Qtr. 1, 2019
$35,110

2016*
$860,000

2017*
$94,310

2018*
$128,349

Qtr. 1, 2019*
$19,741

Remaining Balance
$2,006,923

Kaufman County Justice of the Peace 4
Delinquent Court Fine Collections

Performance Thru March 31, 2019

Total Turnover
$3,611,045

Total Resolved
$1,604,122

Source: Kaufman County JP 4 - April 8, 2019 Court Data Download / Perdue System.  *Cases consisting of the following: fine reductions, dismissals, jail 
credits, community service or cases sent in error.  Collections by Perdue Brandon Fielder Collins & Mott, LLP

Total Case Resolution*
$1,102,400

Total Dollars Collected
$501,722



2016
$400,588

2017
$331,527

2018
$200,423

Qtr. 1, 2019
$75,209

2016*
$733,241

2017*
$253,085

2018*
$186,022

Qtr. 1, 2019*
$67,952

Remaining Balance
$4,575,012

Kaufman County Justice of the Peace 3
Delinquent Court Fine Collections

Performance Thru March 31, 2019

Total Turnover
$6,823,058

Total Resolved
$2,248,046

Source: Kaufman County JP 3 - April 8, 2019 Court Data Download / Perdue System.  *Cases consisting of the following: fine reductions, dismissals, jail 
credits, community service or cases sent in error.  Collections by Perdue Brandon Fielder Collins & Mott, LLP

Total Dollars Collected
$1,007,746

Total Case Resolution*
$1,240,299



2016
$222,902

2017
$74,763

2018
$78,960

Qtr. 1, 2019
$38,803

2016*
$250,230

2017*
$174,804

2018*
$102,567

Qtr. 1, 2019*
$37,266

Remaining Balance
$2,063,767

Kaufman County Justice of the Peace 2
Delinquent Court Fine Collections

Performance Thru March 31, 2019

Total Turnover
$3,044,062

Total Resolved
$980,295

Source: Kaufman County JP 2 - April 8, 2019 Court Data Download / Perdue System.  *Cases consisting of the following: fine reductions, dismissals, jail 
credits, community service or cases sent in error.  Collections by Perdue Brandon Fielder Collins & Mott, LLP

Total Case Resolution*
$564,867

Total Dollars Collected
$415,428



2016
$104,526

2017
$53,166

2018
$53,936

Qtr. 1, 2019
$18,179

2016*
$122,7802017*

$62,659

2018*
$59,191

Qtr. 1, 2019*
$38,608

Remaining Balance
$1,057,599

Kaufman County Justice of the Peace 1
Delinquent Court Fine Collections

Performance Thru March 31, 2019Total Turnover
$1,570,644

Total Resolved
$513,045

Source: Kaufman County JP 1 - April 8, 2019 Court Data Download / Perdue System.  *Cases consisting of the following: fine reductions, dismissals, jail 
credits, community service or cases sent in error. Collections by Perdue Brandon Fielder Collins & Mott, LLP

Total Case Resolution*
$283,238

Total Dollars Collected
$229,807
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Kaufman County Commissioner
Receipt | Transfer | Disposal of County Owned Assets

Commissioner Court 
Meeting Date

Department
Asset 

Number
Date in 
Service

Asset Description
Receipt | Transfer | Disposal

T Y P E

05/08/2019 R&B #4 10354 2000 BAGER EXCAVATOR Trade ‐ City of Kemp

Page 1 of 1



RFP 19-11:  Annual Contract for the Purchase of Fuel, Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-Freeze, and Other Related Automotive Chemicals
Monday, April 29, 2019 | 2:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION

Page 1 of 5

Vendor #1 Sun Coast Resources, Inc.
Vendor #2 Borders & Long Oil, Inc.
Vendor #3 Western Marketing, Inc.
Vendor #4 Marlow Oil Inc.

1.)  Gasoline - Unleaded Plus (89 Octane)

Location
Fixed Mark-
up/gallon

Delivery time Fixed Mark-up/gallon Delivery time
Fixed Mark-
up/gallon

Delivery time
Fixed Mark-
up/gallon

Delivery time

Precinct #1 0.2100$          24 hrs 0.0848$                         24 hrs 0.3000$          24 hrs
Precinct #2 0.2100$          24 hrs 0.0848$                         24 hrs 0.3000$          24 hrs
Precinct #3 0.2100$          24 hrs 0.0848$                         24 hrs 0.3000$          24 hrs
Precinct #4 0.2100$          24 hrs 0.0848$                         24 hrs 0.3000$          24 hrs
KSO 0.2100$          24 hrs 0.0848$                         24 hrs 0.3000$          24 hrs
Brand of Gasoline

Exceptions

2.)  Dyed Diesel

Location
Fixed Mark-
up/gallon

Delivery time Fixed Mark-up/gallon Delivery time
Fixed Mark-
up/gallon

Delivery time
Fixed Mark-
up/gallon

Delivery time

Precinct #1 0.1497$          24 hrs 0.0900$                         24 hrs 0.3000$          24 hrs
Precinct #2 0.1497$          24 hrs 0.0900$                         24 hrs 0.3000$          24 hrs
Precinct #3 0.1497$          24 hrs 0.0900$                         24 hrs 0.3000$          24 hrs
Precinct #4 0.1497$          24 hrs 0.0900$                         24 hrs 0.3000$          24 hrs
KSO 0.1497$          24 hrs 0.0900$                         24 hrs 0.3000$          24 hrs
Brand of Gasoline

Exceptions

deliveries <500 gallons; 
delivery charge of $75; fuel 
monitors available at 
$30/month

All fuel purchases are subject 
to $0.15 /gallon discount if 
paid within 10-days of 
delivery

N/AN/A

No Bid

Sun Coast Resources, Inc. Borders & Long Oil, Inc. Western Marketing, Inc. Marlow Oil Inc.

various unbranded

deliveries <500 gallons; 
delivery charge of $75; fuel 
monitors available at 
$30/month

N/A N/A

All fuel purchases are subject 
to $0.15 /gallon discount if 
paid within 10-days of 
delivery

No Bid

Sun Coast Resources, Inc. Borders & Long Oil, Inc. Western Marketing, Inc. Marlow Oil Inc.

various unbranded

Shell or Exxon

Shell or Exxon No Bid Unbranded

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Unbranded

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid



RFP 19-11:  Annual Contract for the Purchase of Fuel, Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-Freeze, and Other Related Automotive Chemicals
Monday, April 29, 2019 | 2:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION

Page 2 of 5

3.)  Synthetic Blend Engine Motor Oil

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Total Quartz 7000 2.72$              475.20$          
Super S Multi-Flo 
Synthetic Blend 5W20 
SN Plus

 $1.92 in 6-
gallon case 

357.93$          
DuraMAx Syn Blend 
10W30, 5W20, 5W30

2.07$              498.30$          
Cam 2 5W-30 
Synthetic

4.25$              741.00$          

Super S Multi-Flo 
Synthetic Blend 5W30 
SN Plus

 $1.92 in 6-
gallon case 

357.93$          
Cam 2 10W-30 
Synthetic

4.25$              520.00$          

Mobil Super Synthetic  
5W20

 $4.68 in 6-
quart case 

952.31$          

Mobil Super Synthetic 
5W30

 $4.68 in 6-
quart case 

959.33$          

4.)  High Mileage Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Super S Multi-Flo 
Synthetic Blend High 
Mileage 5W20 SN

 $2.01 in 6-
gallon case 

379.12$          
DuraMax High Mileage 
5W30 or 5W20

2.21$              530.20$          
Cam 2 High Mileage 
Syn 5W-30

n/a 520.00$          

Super S Multi-Flo 
Synthetic Blend High 
Mileage 5W30 SN

 $2.01 in 6-
gallon case 

379.12$          
Cam 2 High Mileage 
Syn 10W-30

n/a 520.00$          

Mobil Super High 
Mileage 5W20

 $4.13 in 6-
quart case 

889.11$          

Mobile Super High 
Mileage 5W30

 4.13 in 6-
quart case 

889.11$          

Sun Coast Resources, Inc.

NO BID

Borders & Long Oil, Inc. Western Marketing, Inc.Sun Coast Resources, Inc. Marlow Oil Inc.

Borders & Long Oil, Inc. Western Marketing, Inc. Marlow Oil Inc.



RFP 19-11:  Annual Contract for the Purchase of Fuel, Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-Freeze, and Other Related Automotive Chemicals
Monday, April 29, 2019 | 2:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION

Page 3 of 5

5.)  Diesel Engine Motor Oil

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Total Rubia Optima 
1100

3.25$              572.00$          
Super S FG-2000 
Synthetic Blend 
15W40

 $2.46 in 3-
gallon case 

498.57$          
All Fleet Syn Blend CK-
4 15W40 or 10W30

2.57$              608.30$          Cam 2 15W-40 3.25$              553.00$          

Mobil HDEO 15W40  n/a 555.52$          Shell Rotella 15W-40
 $12.95 / 
gallon 

n/a

Mobil Delvac 1300 
Super 15W40

 $4.72 in 6-
quart case 

740.22$          

6.)  Tractor Hydraulic Oil

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Options
Price Per 

Quart
Price Per 55 
Gallon Drum

Total Dynatrans MP N/A 497.75$          Mobilfluid 424
 $4.42 in 5-
gallon case 

569.56$          
All Fleet Tractor 
Hydraulic Oil - J20C

1.67$              378.71$          Cam 2 303 Hydraulic
 $34 per 5-
gallon 

299.00$          

Super S Supertrac 303 
Tractor Hydraulic Fluid

 $1.36 in 3-
gallon case 

233.06$          
Cam 2 J20-C Premium 
Hydraulic

 $40 per 5-
gallon 

400.00$          

Super S Premium 
Universal J20C Tractor 
Hydraulic Fluid

 $1.92 in 3-
gallon case 

351.31$          

Sun Coast Resources, Inc.

Sun Coast Resources, Inc.

* Min delivery of 200 gallons for all lube products or a 
delivery charge of $100 will be applicable.

Borders & Long Oil, Inc. Western Marketing, Inc.

* Min delivery of 200 gallons for all lube products or a 
delivery charge of $100 will be applicable.

Marlow Oil Inc.

Borders & Long Oil, Inc. Western Marketing, Inc. Marlow Oil Inc.



RFP 19-11:  Annual Contract for the Purchase of Fuel, Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-Freeze, and Other Related Automotive Chemicals
Monday, April 29, 2019 | 2:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION

Page 4 of 5

7.)  Synthetic Gear Lubricant

Options Unit Price per unit Options Unit Price per unit Options Unit Price per unit Options Unit Price per unit

Total SynPro Go 
75w90

Drum 1,430.75$      
Super S Custom Plus 
Synthetic 75W90 GL-F 
Gear Oil

 55 gallon 
drum 

1,018.82$      
All Fleet Syn Gear 
75W90

 55 gallon 
drum 

848.10$          Cam 2 75w90  5-gallon pail 121.00$          

Super S Custom Plus 
Synthetic 75W90 GL-F 
Gear Oil

 35 pound pail 95.89$            
All Fleet Syn Gear 
75W90

gallon 14.00$            Cam 2 75w90  quart case 110.00$          

Mobil Delvac 1 Gear 
Oil 75W90

 55 gallon 
drum 

1,683.60$      
Cam 2 50wt Full 
Synthetic

 quart case 8.00$              

Mobil Delvac 1 Gear 
Oil 75W90

 35 pound pail 164.73$          Cam 2 75w140  5-gallon pail 142.00$          

8.)  Automatic Transmission Fluid

Options Unit Price per unit Options Unit Price per unit Options Unit Price per unit Options Unit Price per unit

Total Fluidmatic MV Drum 774.40$          
Super S Multi-Purpose 
Dexron III/Mercon 
Automatic Trans

 55 gallon 
drum 

408.95$          Dura Max D/M ATF
 55 gallon 
drum 

481.25$          Cam 2 ATF Dexron
 55 gallon 

drum 
500.00$          

Super S Multi-Purpose 
Dexron III/Mercon 
Automatic Trans

 12 quart case 23.32$            Dura Max D/M ATF gallon 8.23$              Cam 2 ATF Dexron  quart 3.00$              

Mobil ATF D/M
 55 gallon 

drum 
580.10$          

Mobil ATF D/M  6 quart case 24.08$            

Sun Coast Resources, Inc.

* Min delivery of 200 gallons for all lube products or a 
delivery charge of $100 will be applicable.

Sun Coast Resources, Inc.

* Min delivery of 200 gallons for all lube products or a 
delivery charge of $100 will be applicable.

Borders & Long Oil, Inc. Western Marketing, Inc. Marlow Oil Inc.

Borders & Long Oil, Inc. Western Marketing, Inc. Marlow Oil Inc.



RFP 19-11:  Annual Contract for the Purchase of Fuel, Oil, Lubricants, Grease, Anti-Freeze, and Other Related Automotive Chemicals
Monday, April 29, 2019 | 2:00 p.m.

BID TABULATION

Page 5 of 5

9.)  Antifreeze

Options Unit Price per unit Options Unit Price per unit Options Unit Price per unit Options Unit Price per unit

Chevron Delo ELC 50-
50

Drum 550.00$          
Super S Extended Life 
HD Truck Antifreeze

 55 gallon 
drum 

653.82$          
Peak Final Charge ELC 
50/50 Extended Life 
Coolant

drum 522.50$          Cam 2 Red 100%
 55 gallon 

drum 
620.00$          

Super S Extended Life 
Red Concentrate 
Antifreeze

 6 gallon case 72.48$            
Peak Final Charge ELC 
50/50 Extended Life 
Coolant

gallon 8.50$              Cam 2 Green 100%
 55 gallon 

drum 
525.00$          

Super S Global 
Universal Gold 50/50 
Antifreeze / Coolant

 6 gallon case 31.43$            
Peak Fleet Charge 
50/50 (Green)

drum 470.25$          Cam 2 Red 50/50
 55 gallon 

drum 
400.00$          

Super S Extended Life 
Red 50/50 Truck 
Antifreeze

 6 gallon case 44.95$            
Peak Fleet Charge 
50/50 (Green)

gallon 7.95$              Cam 2 Green 50/50
 55 gallon 

drum 
360.00$          

Cam 2 Green 50/50  6 gallon case 48.00$            

Documents Included:
Sun Coast 
Resources, 

Inc.

Borders & 
Long Oil, Inc.

Western Marketing, 
Inc.

Marlow Oil 
Inc.

References X X X X
Cert of Eligibility X X X X
Ind Price Determ X X X X Purchasing Department Verification:
Signature Form X X X X
MWBE Status X X X X 4/29/2019
CIQ X X X X Raylan Smith, Purchasing Agent

4/29/2019
Latoya Arthur, Buyer

4/29/2019
Angela Wallace, Buyer

Commissioners' Court Meeting Agenda - May 8, 2019

* Min delivery of 200 gallons for all lube products or a 
delivery charge of $100 will be applicable.

Sun Coast Resources, Inc. Borders & Long Oil, Inc. Western Marketing, Inc. Marlow Oil Inc.















































Account Description 2017 2018 2019 2019 2019

Projected 
to Spend

Total 
Projected 
Actual Inflation Projected Changes

Cost of 
Change

 Total 
Change to 
PY

New 
Budget

Varicance 
to PY

ABC DEPARTMENT Actual Actual Adopted Revised Year to Date
Budget Budget

010-0000-000 SALARY  10,000  10,000  10,000  10,000  5,000  5,000  0  5,000 - 5,000 
010-0000-000 SOCIAL SECURITY  1,000  1,000  1,000  1,000  500  500  0  500 - 500 
010-0000-000 RETIREMENT  1,000  1,000  1,000  1,000  500  500  0  500 - 500 
010-0000-000 OFFICE SUPPLIES  1,000  1,000  1,000  1,000  500  500  0  500 - 500 
010-0000-000 EQUIPMENT (NON-CAPITAL)  1,000  1,000  1,000  1,000  500  500  0  500 - 500 
010-0000-000 MILEAGE, MEALS, LODGING  200  200  200  200  100  100  0  100 - 100 
010-0000-000 TRAINING, EDUCATION, CONFERENC  200  200  200  200  100  100  0  100 - 100 
010-0000-000 SOFTWARE  200  200  200  200  100  100  0  100 - 100 
010-0000-000 DUES  200  200  200  200  100  100  0  100 - 100 
010-0000-000 MISCELLANEOUS  50  50  50  50  25  25  0  25 - 25 

 14,850  14,850  14,850  14,850  7,425  0  7,425  0  0  7,425 - 7,425 

INSTRUCTIONS:
Enter data in the yellow highlighted areas 

Projected to spend: Enter the amount of the remaining budget expected to be spent by year end

Inflation: Enter the inflation percentage projected for any catergory……CPI/ECI, other
Projected Changes: Write out the items expected to change for next year…….new equipment, less staff, etc.

Cost of change: Enter the amount of the total of the changes per line item.

Projected IT Cost: Enter amount provided by IT dept. Consumer Price Index- South Region
Percent Change from-

Catergory Mar-18 Jan-19 Feb-19
https://www.bls.gov/news.release/eci.nr0.htm Food 2.3 0.6 0.3

Shelter 3 0.8 0.3
https://tradingeconomics.com/united-states/consumer-price-index-cpi Vehicles 0.7 0.0 0.5

Gasoline -0.4 16.7 12.1
https://www.bls.gov/regions/southeast/news-release/pdf/consumerpriceindex_south.pdf Education 0.2 0 -0.1

Paper Goods -0.3 3.2 2.1
Energy 0 7.8 5.9

https://www.bls.gov/news.release/eci.nr0.htm
https://tradingeconomics.com/united-states/consumer-price-index-cpi
https://www.bls.gov/regions/southeast/news-release/pdf/consumerpriceindex_south.pdf
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